
Bid Tabulation

ITB 5 - 22 Tire Recapping

Charles Lindsey, Principal Buyer

Email: lindseyc@jccal.org 

Line. 

No.
Description of Work Qty  Unit Price 

 Extended 

Price 
 Unit Price 

 Extended 

Price 
 Unit Price 

 Extended 

Price 
 Unit Price 

 Extended 

Price 

1

Truck Tire (Radial)11R-22.5, 14 PLY 18/32” Traction Drive (G167) 

Pattern Ref. Tread/Compound #2015T/G167 (Goodyear) or Drive-trac 

(Bandag) or Approved Equal

25

120.40$      3,010.00$        129.00$      3,225.00$        169.86$      4,246.50$        -$           -$                

2

Truck Tire (Radial) 11R-22.5, 14 PLY 22/32” Traction Drive (G167) 

Patter Ref. Tread/Compound #2015T/G167 (Goodyear) or D4310 (Bandag) 

or Approved Equal

100
120.40$      12,040.00$      140.00$      14,000.00$      151.47$      15,147.00$      -$           -$                

3

Truck Tire (Radial) 11R-22.5, 14 PLY UNISTEEL II 18/32” Rib (G159) 

Ref. Tread/ Compound Ref #2015T/G167 (Goodyear) or RTP (Bandag) or 

Approved.

25
124.36$      3,109.00$        129.00$      3,225.00$        130.08$      3,252.00$        -$           -$                

4
Truck Tire (Radial) 11R-24.5, 14 PLY 18/32” Traction Drive (G167) 

Pattern Ref Tread/Compound #2015T/G167 (Goodyear) or Drive-Trac 

(Bandag) or Approved Equal

25
123.84$      3,096.00$        132.00$      3,300.00$        156.76$      3,919.00$        -$           -$                

5

Truck Tire (Radial) 11R-24.5, 14 PLY 22/32” Traction Drive (G167)

Pattern Ref. Tread/Compound #2015T/G167 (Goodyear) or D4310

(Bandag) or Approve Equal.

100
123.84$      12,384.00$      140.00$      14,000.00$      156.76$      15,676.00$      -$           -$                

6

Truck Tire (Radial) 11R-24.5, 14 PLY G186/G286 Rib Pattern 18/32”

Rib (G186/286) Ref. Tread/ Compound #2015T/G286 (Goodyear) or

Approved Equal

25
127.58$      3,189.50$        129.00$      3,225.00$        211.59$      5,289.75$        -$           -$                

7

Truck Tire (Radial) 225/70R19.5 Low Profile, 16/32” M&S 

(G124/G622) Pattern Ref. Tread/Compound #2015T/G622 (Goodyear) or

Commercial Traction (Bandag) or Approved Equal

25
78.38$        1,959.50$        88.00$        2,200.00$        123.43$      3,085.75$        -$           -$                

8
Truck Tire (Radial) 255/70R22.5 Low Profile, 11/32” Trailer (G159) 

Pattern Ref. Tread/Compound #2015T/G159 (Goodyear) or BTL 

(Bandag) or Approved Equal

25
84.22$        2,105.50$        99.00$        2,475.00$        115.93$      2,898.25$        -$           -$                

GROUP I: Retread Costs

NO BID

4

Wilks Tire & Battery Service 

Inc.

-$                                      

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

1 2 3

43,499.00$                           52,715.00$                           53,514.25$                           

Bandag  UAP2

Southern Tire Mart Action Tire 

The Goodyear Tire & 

Rubber Co. 

GoodYear/PCT G622 LT  

Pro code 254337411

GoodYear/PCT RDA   Pro 

code 254086587

GoodYear/PCT G167 22  

Pro code 254090702

Mfg. Name & Product No.: GoodYear/PCT G167 22  

Pro code 254090702

Mfg. Name & Product No.: Bandag UAP2
GoodYear/PCT G186  MSA  

Pro code 254090708

Bandag DR4.3

Mfg. Name & Product No.: Bandag DR4.3

Mfg. Name & Product No.:

GRAND TOTAL

Mfg. Name & Product No.: Bandag DR4.3

Mfg. Name & Product No.: Bandage DR4.3
GoodYear/PCT G167 22  

Pro code 254086702

Mfg. Name & Product No.: Bandag UAP2 GoodYear/PCT G159 22  

Pro code 254086027
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Wilks Tire & Battery Service 

Inc.

-$                                      43,499.00$                           52,715.00$                           53,514.25$                           

Southern Tire Mart Action Tire 

The Goodyear Tire & 

Rubber Co. 

GRAND TOTAL

9 SECTION REPAIR #120 25 16.56$        414.00$           0 -$                -$           -$                -$           -$                

10 SECTION REPAIR #140 25 26.86$        671.50$           0 -$                -$           -$                -$           -$                

11 BEAD REPAIR 25 -$           -$                23 575.00$           -$           -$                -$           -$                

1
11R-22.5, 14 PLY

Casings purchased from vendor to meet demand: Grade “A”
10

75.00$        750.00$           65.00$        650.00$           -$           -$                -$           -$                

2
11R-24.5, 14 PLY Casings purchased from vendor to meet demand: Grade 

“A”
10

50.00$        500.00$           65.00$        650.00$           -$           -$                -$           -$                

3 Casing disposal costs for casings not retreadable.  Sizes 19.5 and larger. 10 8.00$          80.00$             12.00$        120.00$           -$           -$                -$           -$                

4 Casing disposal costs for casings not retreadable.  Sizes less than 19.5 10 8.00$          80.00$             7.00$          70.00$             -$           -$                -$           -$                

1 11R-22.5, 14 PLY - Casings sold to vendor: Grade “A” 25 2.00$          50.00$             50.00$        1,250.00$        -$           -$                -$           -$                

2 11R-22.5, 14 PLY-Casings sold to vendor: Grade “B” 25 1.00$          25.00$             50.00$        1,250.00$        -$           -$                -$           -$                

3 11R-24.5, 14 PLY-Casings sold to vendor: Grade “A” 25 1.00$          25.00$             50.00$        1,250.00$        -$           -$                -$           -$                

4 11R-24.5, 14 PLY-Casings sold to vendor: Grade “B” 25 0.40$          10.00$             50.00$        1,250.00$        -$           -$                -$           -$                

1

2

3

4

CONTACT INFORMATION

Southern Tire LLC | 800 Highway 98 Columbia MS 39429 | Attn: Richard Conwill | Ph: 1-877-786--4681 | Fax: 601-651-06555

Action Tire | 2675 Commerce Circle Birmingham AL 305217 | Attn: William Brooks | Ph: 205-849-3037 | Fax: 404-732-1442

GoodYear Commerical Tire & Rubber Co. | 200 Innovation Way Akron OH 44316 | Ph: 330-796-3782 | Fax: 330-796-4276

Wilks Tire & Battery Service Inc. | 428 North Broad Street Albertville, AL  35950 | Ph: Non-Submittal | Fax: Non-Submittal

NOT SIGNED

NOT SIGNED

NOT SIGNED

NOT SIGNED

NOT SIGNED

NOT SIGNED

NOT SIGNED

NOT SIGNED

GROUP II: CASING PURCHASE COSTS FROM CONTRACTOR AND DISPOSAL COSTS

GROUP III: EXCESS CASINGS SOLD TO CONTRACTOR

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

4

Wilks Tire & Battery Service 

Inc.

NOT SIGNED

YES

Amendment No. 1 YES YES YES

Bid Bond YES NO YES

Included NO BIDMfg. Name & Product No.:

Mfg. Name & Product No.: Included NO BID

NO BIDMfg. Name & Product No.:

Mfg. Name & Product No.: Bandag TR 4.1
GoodYear/PCT G159  Pro 

code 254886027

Debarment Statement

Equal Employment Opportunity Certification Form

Signature Page 

PACA Required Forms

REQUIRED FORMS

Experience Statement

Notification fo Intent to Respond

Non-Collusion Affidavit

Adffidavit of Contractor

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

1 2 3

YES

YES

NOT SIGNED

YES

YES

YES

Southern Tire Mart Action Tire 

The Goodyear Tire & 

Rubber Co. 

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

NOT SIGNED

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES
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